The Corporation of the Town of

Gn( NANOQUE
REGULAR COUNCIL MEETING AGENDA

On September 19, 2017 @ 5:00 PM
At Emergency Services Building — 340 Herbert St

Item Title/Description
1 CALL MEETING TO ORDER
2 DISCLOSURE OF PECUNIARY INTEREST & GENERAL NATURE THEREOF
3 CLOSED MEETING OF COUNCIL—5:00 PM
0 Security of property of Municipality or Local Board.
Personal matters concerning an identifiable individual, including Municipal or Board
employee
Committee Appointments
A proposed or pending acquisition or disposition of land by the Municipality
1Item
[0 Labour relations or employee negotiations
Litigation or potential litigations, including matters before administrative tribunals,
affecting the municipality or local board.
1item
[J  Advice that is subject to solicitor-client privilege, including communications necessary for
that purpose.
(] A matterin respect of which a Council, Board, Committee or other body may hold a closed
meeting under another Act.
ADOPTION OF CLOSED MINUTES — September 5, 2017 8
MoVE OUT OF CLOSED SESSION
4 MATTERS ARISING FROM CLOSED SESSION
5 PRESENTATIONS/AWARDS/DEPUTATIONS
6 IMAYOR’S DECLARATIONS
7 UNFINISHED BUSINESS

Terry Gilmer, Manager of Parks and Recreation

Page 1 of 2




kshipclark
File Attachment
CLOSED-Minutes-for-September-5-2017.pdf


September 19, 2017

RECM-2017-03 - Policy Prohibiting the use of Cellular Devices, Cameras, Video Cameras @ 8
and Personal Digital Assistants

Paul McMunn, Manager of Public Works

RDS-2017-06 - Asphalt, Concrete, Paving and Milling (ACPM) Contract 2017-01 Tender Results @

CONSENT AGENDA @

8a | BY-LAWS INCLUDED IN CONSENT AGENDA (1%, 2"%, and/or 3™ Readings)

2017-073 — Council Remuneration and Honorariums g

2017-074 — Encroachment Agreement — 40 Booth St 8

8b | MINUTES OF COUNCIL

Council Minutes — September 5, 2017 @

MOTIONS (Council Direction to Staff)

10

NoTice REQUIRED UNDER THE NOTICE BY-LAW

11

CommITTEE UPDATES (COUNCIL REPS)

12

MISCELLANEOUS BUSINESS

Brenda Guy, Community Development Manager

CD-2017-13 - Purchase and Sale Agreement — Island Harbour Club — Acknowledgement and g 8
Direction

13

CONFIRMATION BY-LAW

By-law 2017-076 —Confirm the proceedings of Council for the meeting held on September 19, 2017.
g (3 Readings)

14

ADJOURNMENT
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G+SNANOQUE

Council Report — RECM-2017-03

Date: September 19, 2017 O IN CAMERA

Subject: Policy Prohibiting the use of Cellular Devices, Cameras, Video Cameras
and Personal Digital Assistants

Author: Terry Gilmer, Manager of Parks and Recreation OPEN SESSION

RECOMMENDATION:

BE IT RESOLVED THAT THE COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF GANANOQUE APPROVE BY-LAW 2017-
076 BEING A BY-LAW TO ESTABLISH A POLICY PROHIBITING THE USE OF CELLULAR DEVICES,
CAMERAS, VIDEO CAMERAS AND PERSONAL DIGITAL ASSISTANTS FROM RECREATIONAL FACILITY
BATHROOMS, CHANGE ROOMS AND SHOWERS, AS PER COUNCIL REPORT RECM-2017-03.

STRATEGIC PLAN COMMENTS:
Sector #5 — Community Protection - Strategic Initiative #3 — Make the Health & Safety of all staff and
citizens a key priority.

BACKGROUND:

On September 5, 2017, Councilor Jansen presented a motion, which was approved by Council,
recommending that the Council of the Town of Gananoque direct staff to develop a policy
prohibiting cellular devices, cameras, video cameras and personal digital assistants (PDAs) from the
change rooms located at the Lou Jeffries, Gananoque and T.L.T.l. Recreation Centre.

INFORMATION/DISCUSSION:
Staff have prepared said policy and expanded the scope to include additional recreational facilities.
See attachment.

APPLICABLE POLICY/LEGISLATION:
Ontario Health and Safety Act

FINANCIAL CONSIDERATIONS:
N/A

CONSULTATIONS:
Shellee Fournier, CAO, Town Of Gananoque
Garry Hull, Police Chief, Town of Gananoque

ATTACHMENTS:
Policy 2017-11 - Policy — Prohibiting the use of Cellular Devices, Cameras, Video Cameras
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Report To Council September 19, 2017
RECM-2017-03

and Personal Digital Assistants from Recreational Facility Bathrooms, Change Rooms and Showers

Terry Gilmer, Manager of Parks and Recreation

Melanie Kirkby, Treasurer
Certifies that unless otherwise provided for in this report the funds are contained within the approved Budgets
and that the financial transactions are in compliance with Council’s own policies and guidelines and the Municipal
Act and regulations.

APPROVAL

Shellee Fournier, CAO
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"T THE CORPORATION OF THE TOWN OF GANANOQUE

POLICY NO. 2017-11 APPROVAL DATE: September 19, 2017

Parks, Recreation and

AUTHORITY
UTHO Marina Manager

EFFECTIVE DATE: September 20, 2017

PROHIBITING THE USE OF CELLULAR DEVICES, CAMERAS, VIDEO CAMERAS
SUBJECT AND PERSONAL DIGITAL ASSISTANTS FROM RECREATIONAL FACILITY
BATHROOMS, CHANGE ROOMS AND SHOWERS

PURPOSE

To establish a policy prohibiting the use of cellular phones, cameras, video cameras and personal
digital assistants (PDAs) in bathrooms, change rooms and showers located at recreational facilities
including the Lou Jeffries Recreation Centre, the Gananoque Municipal Marina, and the washrooms
located at Joel Stone Park.

SCOPE

This policy applies to users while in bathrooms, change rooms or shower areas, or any other
recreational area where someone would have a reasonable expectation of privacy.

POLICY

Town of Gananoque recreational facilities are operated for the benefit of the community. It is
essential to the enjoyment of the community that a non-threatening, pleasant atmosphere be
maintained and that the behavior of a patron not be allowed to disrupt the experience of others.

Youth are particularly vulnerable in locker rooms, changing areas and restrooms due to various
stages of dress/undress and because they are often less supervised than at other times. Athlete-to-
athlete problems, such as sexual abuse, bullying, harassment or hazing, often occur when a coach or
other responsible adult is not in a position to observe — this is especially true in locker rooms.
Adherence to this policy will enhance privacy and reduces the likelihood of misconduct.

This policy is intended to help achieve this goal by imposing the minimum restrictions necessary on
the action of any individual. A violation could result in the suspension of privileges at the discretion
of the Parks and Recreation Manager. Depending on the severity of the offense the suspension can
be as little as asking the individual to leave for the remainder of the day or as much as a permanent
suspension. When applicable, first time suspensions will be handled with a 24 hour suspension from
Town recreational facilities. Repetitive infractions will result in increasingly longer suspensions or
revocation of Town recreational facilities privileges indefinitely. Suspensions for additional
violations will be determined on an individual basis by the Parks and Recreation Manager. The
nature and seriousness of the offense will determine the length of the suspension. Aggravated
circumstances, even for a first offense, may warrant a longer period of suspension. The parent(s) of
a minor must be notified if their child has been suspended from Town recreational facilities.

Appeals - Any person opposed to the action of having their privileges suspended may appeal the
action by writing a letter to council setting forth the reason(s) such person believes the suspension
is improper and submitting it to the Clerk. Such appeal shall be considered and ruled upon by
Council at their next regularly scheduled meeting. The decision of Council shall be final. Suspension
shall continue in effect pending the appeal.





Detailed incident reports must be prepared for each incident by staff on duty. Name of the parties
involved, addresses, phone numbers, description of incident and action taken should be included on
all reports. Copies of all reports are to be reviewed by the Parks and Recreation Manager. If an
individual is requested to leave Town recreational facilities and has made prior transportation
arrangements, the individual will be allowed to sit quietly in the front lobby to wait for their ride. If
an individual is suspended for any reason outlined within this policy, no refunds of daily admission
fees or annual pass user fees shall be granted.

PROCEDURE

1. Facility users are asked to immediately report any concerns to staff related to others using
prohibited devices in bathrooms, change rooms and showers located at Town recreational
facilities.

2. Once concerns are reported to staff, they will contact the Manager of Parks and Recreation who
will determine the course of action.
a. Staff will complete an incident report.

3. Inappropriate behavior could result in suspension from Town recreational facilities by the
Manager of Parks and Recreation and is subject to all relevant municipal and federal laws.
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G ,,( NANOQUE
Council Report — RDS-2017-06

Council Date: September 19, 2017 0 IN CAMERA

Subject: Asphalt, Concrete, Paving and Milling (ACPM)
Contract 2017-01 Tender Results

Author: Paul McMunn, Manager of Public Works OPEN COUNCIL

RECOMMENDATION

BE IT RESOLVED THAT THE COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF GANANOQUE HEREBY DEFER THE 2017
MILLING AND PAVING PORTION OF WORK FROM THE ANNUAL ASPHALT, CONCRETE, PAVING AND
MILLING (ACPM) PROGRAM;

AND FURTHER, THAT COUNCIL APPROVE THE DEFERRAL OF A MINIMUM OF $180,000 TO THE 2018
ASPHALT, CONCRETE, PAVING AND MILLING (ACPM) PROGRAM, AS PRESENTED IN COUNCIL
REPORT RDS-2017-06.

STRATEGIC PLAN COMMENTS
Sector 2 — Infrastructure/Environment — Strategic Initiative #1 — Assess the Town’s current
infrastructure to ensure sufficient capacity exists to support future growth.

BACKGROUND

During the Committee of the Whole meeting on September 5, 2017, the Committee recommended
that Council approve locations for the 2017 Asphalt, Concrete, Paving and Milling contracts, as
presented in Committee of the Whole report RDS-2017-08. The Public Works Department
called a tender on August 29, 2017, with a closing date of September 12, 2017.

INFORMATION/DISCUSSION
This report is coming straight to Council, as it is time sensitive to decide if the work will commence
this fall or wait until summer of 2018.

Five (5) contractors received tender packages. One (1) bid was received and opened at the
tender opening, which was from Cruickshank Construction Ltd. The summary is as follows:

CONTRACTOR TOTAL BID PRICE (not including HST)
Cruickshank Construction Ltd. $168,689.00

G. Tackaberry and Sons Construction No Bid

Coco Paving Inc. No Bid

G. Williams Paving No Bid

Cornwall Gravel Co. Ltd. No Bid
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Council Report Date September 19, 2017
RDS-2017-06

The tender package that was issued, clearly states in the instructions to tenderers that “The
Corporation of the Town of Gananoque reserves the right to reject any or all Tenders if it is deemed
advisable to do so, and the lowest or any tender will not necessarily be accepted”.

The tender that was submitted meets the requirements of the tender process (submission of bid
bond and performance bond), however due to there only being one (1) bid, it does not allow for a
comparison of unit prices against other proponents. It is difficult to determine if the unit bid prices
are fair, based on current markets. Staff are of the opinion, based on previous year’s unit prices and
comparing unit prices against neighboring municipalities that have conducted milling and paving
operations this past summer, the unit prices bid for Hot Mix Paving are high. The unit price bid for
asphalt was $140/tonne, which most likely is a result of lower tendered quantities and the time of
year for the work to commence.

This tender call was purposefully delayed until after the tourist season, as staff were of the opinion
that vehicular and pedestrian traffic through town would increase this summer because of Canada
150.

It is recommended that Milling and Paving operations (and approved locations) for 2017 be deferred
to the summer of 2018 to take advantage of economies of scale. Doing so will result in increased
guantities both for milling and paving, as well, allow contractors to bid the work earlier in the season
when pricing is more competitive. This tender can be issued in March 2018, with the work being
completed July-August 2018.

It should be noted that staff will continue with the replacement of concrete curb and sidewalk work
on King Street. Replacement of concrete curb and sidewalk has commenced on King Street from the
King Street Bridge to Charles Street.

APPLICABLE POLICY/LEGISLATION:
Procurement By-Law 2015-087

FINANCIAL CONSIDERATIONS:

$600,000 was approved in the 2017 Capital Budget for the Asphalt, Concrete, Paving and Milling
(ACPM) Program. The portion of the $600,000 that was remaining following the tender opening for
Milling and Paving was to be allocated to curb and sidewalk removal and replacement, some traffic
light infrastructure relocation at the two (2) intersections, and reinstatement of line painting (can be
deferred to 2018, estimate of $10,000) within the limits of construction.

It is recommended that a minimum of $180,000 of the 2017 ACPM budget be carried forward to the
2018 ACPM program. In addition, staff will have a final figure of any further unused amounts from
the 2017 work to be carried forward. This will be presented during the 2018 Capital Budget
deliberations.
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Council Report Date September 19, 2017
RDS-2017-06

CONSULTATIONS:
Melanie Kirkby, Treasurer

ATTACHMENTS:
None

Paul McMunn, Manager of Public Works

Melanie Kirkby, Treasurer
Certifies that unless otherwise provided for in this report the funds are contained within the approved Budgets
and that the financial transactions are in compliance with Council’s own policies and guidelines and the
Municipal Act and regulations.

APPROVAL

Shellee Fournier, CAO
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THE CORPORATION OF THE TOWN OF GANANOQUE BY-LAW
BY-LAW NO. 2017-076

BEING A BY-LAW TO ESTABLISH A POLICY PROHIBITING THE USE OF CELLULAR
DEVICES, CAMERAS, VIDEO CAMERAS AND PERSONAL DIGITAL ASSISTANTS
FROM RECREATIONAL FACILITY BATHROOMS, CHANGE ROOMS AND SHOWERS
FOR THETOWN OF GANANOQUE.

AND WHEREAS section 5 of the Municipal Act, 2001, S.0. 2001, c. 25, the powers of a municipal
corporation are to be exercised by its Council;

AND WHEREAS the Municipal Act, 2001, S.0. 2001, c. 25, provided that the powers of every
Council are to be exercised by By-law;

NOW THEREFORE the Council of the Corporation of the Town of Gananoque enacts as follows:

1. That the Policy Prohibiting the use of Cellular Devices, Cameras, Video Cameras and
Personal Digital Assistants from Recreational Facility Bathrooms, Change Rooms and
Showers for the Town of Gananoque attached hereto as Schedule ‘A’ and forming part of
this by-law is hereby adopted.

2. That this by-law come into force and effect on the date of passing.

3. That any by-law inconsistent with this by-law is hereby repealed.

READ THREE TIMES and finally passed this 19t" day of September 2017.

Mayor, Erika Demchuk Clerk, Kelly Shipclark
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The Corporation of the Separate Town of Gananoque
MOTION / RESOLUTION OF COUNCIL

DATE: September 19, 2017 MOTION NO. 2017 -

MOVED BY:

SECONDED BY:

Be it resolved that the By-laws and Motions listed on the Consent Agenda be passed accordingly:

BY-LAWS (1%, 2", and/or 3" Readings)

2017-073 — Council Remuneration and Honorariums

2017-074 — Encroachment Agreement — 40 Booth St

MOTIONS

Approval of Council Minutes — September 5, 2017

Be it resolved that the Council of the Town of Gananoque hereby approve the minutes for September 5, 2017.

Approve Committee of the Whole Report CD-2017-15 - CPPS2017-11 — Anderson (462 Stone Street S)

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of Gananoque
approves CPP2017-11 — Anderson at 462 Stone Street South subject to all conditions being met, as presented in
Committee of the Whole report CD-2017-15.

Direct Mr. Tulk’s Questions to Staff regarding the Town Hall Addition

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of Gananoque
direct Mr. Tulk’s questions to staff.

Receive Accounts Payable from August 12, 2017 to August 29, 2017

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of Gananoque
receives the Statement of Accounts Payable for Cheques issued from August 12, 2017 to August 29, 2017 totalling
$486,342.93 as presented.

Approve Committee of the Whole Report CAO-2017-03 - Council Remuneration — Honorariums and Allowances

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of Gananoque
hereby approved Option 3 (honorariums be increased to match the average of the survey with no annual
increases awarded in years 2020, 2021 and 2022) to be amended with a progressive 4 year graduated increase to
parity with regards to Council remuneration for the 2019-2022 term of Council, as presented in Committee of the
Whole report CAO-2017-03.

Approve Committee of the Whole Report CAO-2017-04 - 400 Stone Street North (Kinsmen Building)

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of Gananoque
hereby direct staff to issue a Request for Proposals to qualified consultants to conduct a highest and best use
feasibility study for the former Kinsmen Building (400 Stone Street North),

And further, that the cost of the study (approximately $15k-$20k) be taken from reserves, as presented in
Committee of the Whole report CAO-2017-04.






Receive Committee of the Whole Report FIN-2017-25 — 2016 Management Letter

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of Gananoque hereby
receive the 2016 Management Letter, as presented in Committee of the Whole report FIN-2017-25.

Approve Committee of the Whole Report RDS-2017-07 - Bay Road Options

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of Gananoque
hereby selects Option C (Marina Location excluding parking and paving and referred to 2018 budget
deliberations), as presented in Committee of the Whole report RDS-2017-07, Re: Bay Road.

Approve Committee of the Whole Report RDS-2017-08 - 2017 - Asphalt, Concrete, Paving, and Milling (ACPM) -
Update

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of Gananoque hereby
approve locations for the 2017 asphalt, concrete, paving and milling contracts, as presented in Committee of the Whole
report RDS-2017-08.

Approve Committee of the Whole Report RDS-2017-09 - 2017 - Encroachment Agreement - 40 Booth Street
(Donovan)

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of Gananoque hereby
authorize the Mayor and Clerk to enter into an Encroachment Agreement with Theresa Mary Donovan and Paul Joseph
Donovan at 40 Booth Street, as presented in Committee of the Whole report RDS-2017-09.

Approve Committee of the Whole Report CD-2017-14 - PROP2017-05 — HVAC for Library, Visitor Centre and
Archives - 10 King Street East

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of Gananoque
hereby direct staff to separate tender PROP2017-05 to include the heat and air for the Library portion of the
building only, and re-issue the tender, as presented in Committee of Whole report CD-2017-14.

Directs Staff to Develop a Policy Prohibiting Cellular Devices/Cameras at the Lou Jeffries, Gananoque and
T.L.T.l. Recreation Centre.

WHEREAS, technological advancements have created cellular devices, personal digital assistants, etc. to carry
new functions, such as cameras, that allow users to photograph others while appearing to dial a number;

AND WHEREAS, these devices are very popular and widespread;

AND WHEREAS, the potential exists for deviant behaviour of camera-phone users photographing others
undressing and showering in change rooms;

AND WHEREAS, taking and posting photos on the Internet is a violation of personal privacy;
AND WHEREAS, concerns have been raised by the Gananoque Hockey Association(s) as well as parents;
NOW THEREFORE, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of Gananoque

hereby direct staff to develop a policy prohibiting cellular devices, cameras, video cameras and personal digital
assistants (PDAs) from the change rooms located at the Lou Jeffries, Gananoque and T.L.T.l. Recreation Centre.

Save and Except

2017-073 — Council Remuneration and Honorariums

CAO-2017-03 - Council Remuneration — Honorariums and Allowances






Yaes Nays

Carried: Mayor, Erika Demchuk

Defeated:

Tabled/Deferred: MA s. 246 - When a recorded vote is requested, the Clerk will call for each Councillors vote
(Yea or Nay), mark the recorded vote as indicated by the member, and announce whether the motion is carried or defeated. The Mayor
will then sign the motion.

RECORDED VOTE: Yea | Nay
Fletcher D.

Warren A.

Jansen J.

Girling J.

Hayes J.

Brooks B.

Demchuk E.

TOTALS
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CORPORATION OF THE TOWN OF GANANOQUE

BYLAW NO. 2017-073

BEING A BY-LAW TO ESTABLISH REMUNERATION AND EXPENSES FOR THE MEMBERS
OF COUNCIL AND LOCAL BOARDS FOR THE CORPORATION OF THE TOWN OF
GANANOOUE.

WHEREAS Section 283 of the Municipal Act, 2001, S.0. 2001 c.25, as amended
provides for the passing of by-laws for the paying of remuneration and expenses to
members of Council and members of any local board of the municipality and of the
officers and employees of the local board.

AND WHEREAS the Town of Gananoque did not revoke the resolution under
subsection 255 (2) or (3) of the old Act before January 1, 2003, declaring that one
third of the remuneration paid to the elected members of council is deemed as
expenses incident to the discharge of their duties as members of the council;

AND WHEREAS under Section 283 (5) of the Municipal Act, S.0. 2001, c.25, such
resolution shall be deemed to be a by-law of the municipality;

AND WHEREAS by Section 5 of the Municipal Act, 2001, S.0. 2001, c. 25, the powers
of a municipal corporation are to be exercised by its Council;

AND WHEREAS Subsection 2 of Section 11 of the Municipal Act, 2001, S.0. 2001, c.
25, the powers of every Council are to be exercised by Bylaw; and

AND WHEREAS the Municipal Act, S.0. 2011, c. 25, section 8 (1) provides in part that
the powers of a municipality under the Municipal Act shall be interpreted to enable
the municipality to govern its affairs as it considers appropriate.

NOW THEREFORE the Council of the Corporation of the Town of Gananoque hereby
enact as follows;

1. Effective January 1, 2019, an annual allowance shall be paid to each member
of the Council of the Corporation of the Town of Gananoque, as set out in
Schedule ‘A’ attached hereto.

2. Such allowance shall be paid bi-weekly, and in the event of the death of a
member or upon his/her ceasing to be a member for any reason before the
expiration of his or her term of office, the amount payable to him/her or to
his/her personal representative shall be in proportion to the period of his/her
service during such term.

3. Effective January 1, 2019 annual honorariums shall be paid to each member of
the Council of the Corporation of the Town of Gananoque designated as a
member of a Joint Service Committee, as set out in Schedule “B” attached
hereto.

4. In accordance with Section 283 (5) of the Municipal Act, 2001, that one-third
of the amount payable to members of Council shall be deemed to be for
expenses incident to the discharge of a members duties and therefore exempt
from Income Tax.

5. That this by-law come into force and effect on the date of passing.

READ A FIRST, SECOND, AND THIRD TIME, passed, signed, and sealed with the
corporate seal this 19t day of September, 2017.

Mayor, Erika Demchuk Clerk, Kelly Shipclark





COUNCIL REMUNERATION ANE EXPENSES

Schedule ‘A’ 2017-073

Annual Base Allowance Commencing January 1% 2019
Position January 2019 | January 2020 | January 2021 January 2022
Mayor $22,404.48 $24,117.98 $25,831.49 $27,545.00
Deputy Mayor $13,591.12 $14,716.41 $15,841.71 $16,967.00
Councillor (x5) $12,326.47 $13,023.31 $13,720.16 $14,417.00
Total $ 97,627.92 | $103,950.95 $110,273.97 $116,597.00

Schedule ‘B’ 2017-073

Annual Honorarium as of January 1% 2019
Joint Service Committee | $1,830.14
Joint Services Sub Committees
Land Ambulance $1,830.14
Community and Social Services $1,830.14
St. Lawrence Lodge Management $1,830.14
TOTAL $7,320.56
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THE CORPORATION OF THE TOWN OF GANANOQUE BY-LAW NO.

2017-074

BEING ABY-LAW TO ALLOW AN ENCROACHMENT AT 40 BOOTH STREET IN THE TOWN OF
GANANOQUE

WHEREAS Section 8.(1) of the Municipal Act, 2001, S.0. 2001, c.25 as amended, provides that
the powers of a municipality under this or any other Act, shall be interpreted broadly so as to
confer broad authority on the municipality to enable the municipality to govern its affairs as it
considers appropriate and to enhance the municipality’s ability to respond to municipal issues;

AND WHEREAS Section 9 of the Municipal Act, 2001, provides that a municipality has the
capacity, rights, powers and privileges of a natural person for the purpose of exercising its
authority under this or any other Act;

AND WHEREAS Section 10(1) of the Municipal Act 2001 provides that a single-tier municipality
may provide any service or thing that the municipality considers necessary or desirable for the
public;

NOW THEREFORE the Council of the Corporation of the Town of Gananoque enacts as follows:

1. The owner or owners of Plan 86 East, BLK V, PT. Lot 24, Pt. Lot 25, RP 28R-7283, Pts. 3 and 6,
PIN 44253-0233, East of the Gananoque River, Town of Gananoque, north side of Booth
Street known municipally as 40 Booth Street shall be permitted to encroach four (4) feet into
the municipal storm sewer easement for purposed of installing an in ground pool as shown
on the plan attached hereto and marked as Schedule “A” to this by-law.

2. The owner agrees to indemnify and save harmless the Corporation of the Town of
Gananoque from any damage that may arise to the pool and structures should the
Corporation of the Town of Gananoque be required to work on the easement, and the
Owner(s) shall accept the risk of such damage and release the Corporation of the Town of
Gananoque from any claim for damages by the contractor, their offices, employees or other
persons for whom the contractor is legally responsible.

3. This by-law shall ensure to and be binding upon the heirs, executors, administrators,
successors and assigns of the owner respectively.

4. This by-law shall come into force and take effect upon its final passage.

READ THREE TIMES and finally passed this 19" day of September 2017.

Mayor, Erika Demchuk Clerk, Kelly Shipclark
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The Corporation of the Town of

G« S NANOQUE
REGULAR COUNCIL MEETING MINUTES

On September 5, 2017 @ 5:00 PM
At Emergency Services Building — 340 Herbert St DRAFT

Item Title/Description

CouNnciL MEMBERS PRESENT STAFF PRESENT

MAYOR: Erika Demchuk Shellee Fournier, CAO

COUNCILLORS: Joe Jansen Linda Robinson, Deputy Clerk
Brian Brooks Linda Sicoli, Interim Economic Development Manager
Anne Warren Brenda Guy, Manager of Community Development
Jan Hayes Paul McMunn, Manager of Public Works
Jeff Girling Gary Bullock, Acting Fire Chief

Melanie Kirkby, Treasurer

Terry Gilmer, Manager of Parks & Recreation

Steve Tiernan, Fire Chief

REGRETS: Dwayne Fletcher Kelly Shipclark, Clerk

Sherri Ogilvie, Public Utilities Supervisor

1 CALL MEETING TO ORDER

Mayor Demchuk called the Regular Council meeting to order at 5:00 PM

2 DISCLOSURE OF PECUNIARY INTEREST & GENERAL NATURE THEREOF

Councillor Brooks declared a conflict of interest on item identified on this meeting’s
agenda as Integrity Commissioner; due to him being the former Banker/Account
Manager for Templeman/Menninga Law Firm.

3 CLosED MEETING OF COUNCIL

ResoLuTION No. 2017-113 Moved by: Councillor Hayes Seconded by: Councillor Warren
Be it resolved that Council move into closed session for:

Personal matters concerning an identifiable individual, including Municipal or
Board employee

Integrity Commissioner

Staffing Re-organization
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Council Minutes for September 5, 2017

Item Title/Description
CARRIED
ResoLUTION No. 2017-114 Moved by: Councillor Jansen Seconded by: Councillor Warren
Be it resolved that the Council of the Town of Gananoque hereby move out of closed
session.
CARRIED
4 IMIATTERS ARISING FROM CLOSED SESSION
A Closed meeting was held tonight. There were 2 items being considered. Both items
was concerning personal matters concerning an identifiable individual, including
Municipal or Board employee. The following motions are to be considered.
Councillor Brooks refrained from voting.
ResoLuTION No. 2017-115 Moved by: Councillor Warren Seconded by: Councillor Jansen
WHEREAS, the Town has received a complaint brought under the Council Code of
Conduct,
AND WHEREAS, there is a right for investigation provided in the Town’s said Code of
Conduct,
AND WHEREAS, Bill 68 is not yet in force and effect,
NOW THEREFORE, Be it resolved that the Council of the Town of Gananoque hereby
pass By-law 2017-070 being a by-law to appoint William Hunter of Vice & Hunter LLP as
the Integrity Commissioner for the Town of Gananoque for a period commencing
immediately through to the end of December 31t 2018, be read three times and finally
passed this 5" day of September, 2017.
CARRIED
ResoLuTION No. 2017-116 Moved by: Councillor Warren Seconded by: Councillor Jansen
Be it resolved that the Council of the Town of Gananoque hereby approve the hiring of
a Public Works Project Coordinator in lieu of an Administrative Assistant.
CARRIED
5 PRESENTATIONS/AWARDS/DEPUTATION
Mayor Demchuk introduced the Town’s New Fire Chief, Steve Tiernan. Acting Chief
Bullock to said a few words.
Acting Fire Chief Bullock and Fire Chief, Steve Tiernan — Fire Fighter Amanda Smith was
presented with 2 certificates
6 MAYOR’S DECLARATIONS
7 UNFINISHED BUSINESS
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Item

Title/Description

RDS-2017-05 - Ontario Community Infrastructure Fund (OCIF) Top Up - Hudson Bridge
Replacement
ResoLuTION No. 2017-117 Moved by: Councillor Jansen Seconded by: Councillor Brooks

Be it resolved that the Council of the Town of Gananoque hereby authorize staff to
submit the Hudson Bridge Replacement Project as the project for the 2017 Intake of
Ontario Community Infrastructure Fund Top-Up Application;

And further, that Council authorize the Mayor and Clerk to execute an agreement with
Golder Associates Ltd. at a cost of $10,549 plus HST to perform a Cultural Heritage
Evaluation report and Heritage Impact Assessment to support the OCIF application
requirements;

And further, that funds from the 2017 Capital Reserve (Hudson Bridge) be used to
support the required assessments, as presented in Council report RDS-2017-05.
CARRIED

ResoLuTION No. 2017-118 Moved by: Councillor Brooks Seconded by: Councillor Jansen

Be it resolved that By-law 2017-071 being a By-law to authorize the Town of
Gananoque to enter into an agreement with Golder Associates Ltd. to perform a
Cultural Heritage Evaluation report and Heritage Impact Assessment of the Hudson
Bridge be read three times and finally passed this 5" day of September, 2017.

CARRIED

ED-2017-04 - RiverLaunch Funding Support
ResoLuTION No. 2017-119 Moved by: Councillor Warren Seconded by: Councillor Jansen

Be it resolved that the Council of the Town of Gananoque authorize the allocation of
$60,000 from the Economic Development Casino Reserve to be used as matching funds
for a Grant Application through the Thousand Islands Community Development
Corporation to further support the development of the Riverlaunch Business Incubator,
as presented in Council report ED-2017-04.

CARRIED

CONSENT AGENDA

ResoLuTION No. 2017-120 MoveD by: Councillor Jansen Seconded by: Councillor Warren
Be it resolved that the By-laws and Motions listed on the Consent Agenda be passed
accordingly:

BY-LAWS INCLUDED IN THE CONSENT AGENDA

By-law 2016-075 - CIP - Tax Cancellation By-law - 15 Clarence St (3™ Reading)

By-law 2016-077 - CIP - Tax Cancellation By-law - 185 Mill St (3™ Reading)

By-law 2016-079 - CIP - Tax Cancellation By-law - 60 Mill St (3" Reading)

By-law 2017-063 — Amend Committee Appointments (3 Readings)
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Item Title/Description

By-law 2017-064 — Amend By-law 2010-046 - Noise By-law (3 Readings)

By-law 2017-065 — Agreement with Home Ice Advantage — Arena Canteen (3 Readings)

By-law 2017-066 — Amend By-law 2016-046 — Arena and Marina Rates (3 Readings)

By-law 2017-068 - Agreement Extension - Clarence Street Development (3 Readings)

By-law 2017-069 - Agreement Intelivote Systems Inc. - Electronic and Telephone
Voting (3 Readings)

Motions

Approval of Council Minutes — August 22, 2017

Be it resolved that the Council of the Town of Gananoque hereby approve the minutes for
August 22, 2017.

Direct Staff to Send a Letter to the Ministry of Environment and Climate Change supporting

Bill 141 — Sewage Bypass Reporting Act, 2017.

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town
of Gananoque direct staff to send a letter to the Ministry of Environment and Climate Change
supporting the private member’s Bill 141 — Sewage Bypass Reporting Act, 2017.

Receive Accounts Payable from July 11, 2017 to August 11, 2017

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town
of Gananoque receives the Statement of Accounts Payable for Cheques issued from July 11,
2017 to August 11, 2017 totalling $726,042.19 as presented.

Approve Option 1 in Committee of the Whole Report CSC-2017-07 - Electronic Voting
Services for the 2018 Municipal Election

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town
of Gananoque hereby approve Option 1 (set aside procurement By-law and enter agreement
with Intelivote Systems Inc. for the 2018 election) with regards to the Electronic Voting Service
for the 2018 election, as presented in Committee of the Whole report CSC-2017-07.

Receive Committee of the Whole Report FIN-2017-23 — Capital Matters Pending

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town
of Gananoque hereby receive the Capital Matters Pending update, as presented in Committee
of the Whole report FIN-2017-23.

Receive Committee of the Whole Report FIN-2017-24 — 2017 2" Quarter Financial Results

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town
of Gananoque hereby receive the 2017 Second Quarter Financial Results, as presented in
Committee of the Whole report FIN-2017-24.

Approve Committee of the Whole Report ED-2017-13 - Marine Fueling Business Case

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town
of Gananoque hereby receive the Marine Fueling Business Case completed by MclLaren
Municipal Consulting and direct staff to proceed with the Consultant’s way forward approach,
as presented in Committee of the Whole report ED-2017-13.

Page 4 of 7






Council Minutes for September 5, 2017

Item Title/Description

Receive Committee of the Whole Report FIRE-2017-04 - 2"¢ Quarter Fire Report

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town
of Gananoque hereby receive this report for information purposes, as presented in the
Committee of the Whole report FIRE-2017-04.

Receive Committee of the Whole Report UTIL-2017-06 - Public Utilities 2" Quarter Report

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of
Gananoque hereby receive the Utilities Second Quarter Report for information purposes, as
presented in Committee of the Whole report UTIL-2017-06.

Approve Committee of the Whole Report RDS-2017-06 - Proposed Location - Rogers
Telecommunication Site

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of
Gananoque hereby authorizes the new location of the Rogers Communication Ltd.,
Telecommunication Tower, as presented in Committee of the Whole report RDS-2017-06.

Approve Committee of the Whole Report RECM-2017-10 - Fees and Rates — Community
Recreational Services & Marina

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of
Gananoque hereby approves By-Law 2017-066 Being a By-Law to amend the General Fees & Rates
By-Law for Schedules “H” And “K” for Community Recreational Services and the Marina, as
presented in Committee of Whole report RECM-2017-010, as amended.

Approve Committee of the Whole Report RECM-2017-11 — Oak Street Park - Community
Garden

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of
Gananoque hereby approve the Brockville and District Association for Community Involvement’s
request for the addition of a Community Garden in Oak Street Park, as presented in Committee of
the Whole report RECM-2017-11, subject to approval by Public Health and/or Ministry of the
Environment.

Approve Committee of the Whole Report CD-2017-11 - Noise By-law 2010-046 - Application
by Ainley Group

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of
Gananoque hereby adopt By-law 2017-064 amending By-law 2010-046 being a By-law to prohibit
and to regulate noise for the purpose of a noise exemption to the Ministry of Transportation, as
presented in Committee of the Whole report CD-2017-11.

Approve Committee of the Whole Report CD-2017-12 - Purchase and Sale Agreement -
Clarence Street Developments

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town of
Gananogque hereby approve a timeline extension to July 1, 2018 with Clarence Street Developments
for 15 Clarence Street as per the Purchase and Sale Agreement, and further authorize the Mayor
and Clerk to sign the Extension Agreement, as presented in Committee of the Whole report CD-
2017-12.

Approve Committee of the Whole Report CD-2017-13 - Community Improvement Plan —
Brownfields - Clarence Street Developments

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town
of Gananoque hereby adopt third and final reading of the following By-laws:
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e By-law 2016-075 (15 Clarence Street),

e By-law 2016-077 (185 Mill Street) and

e By-law 2016-079 (60 Mill Street)
for the purpose of cancelling Municipal and Educational Taxes as per the Minister of Finance
approval letter dated August 8, 2017, as presented in Committee of the Whole report CD-2017-13.

CARRIED

Councillor Brooks refrained from voting.
ResoLuTION No. 2017-121 Moved by: Councillor Hayes Seconded by: Councillor Warren

Be it resolved, as recommended by the Committee of the Whole, that the Council of the Town
of Gananoque hereby approve Option 1 (share the 2017 invoice costs) regarding the cost of
the Structural Review Invoice for the Stage for the 2017 Ribfest, as presented in Committee of
the Whole report RECM-2017-09.

CARRIED

9 MOTIONS (Council Direction to Staff)

10 NoTice REQUIRED UNDER THE NOTICE BY-LAW - NONE

11 | COMMITTEE UPDATES (COUNCIL REPS) - NONE

12 MISCELLANEOUS BUSINESS

Appoint the Fire Chief for the Town of Gananoque — By-law 2017-067
ResoLuTION No. 2017-122 Moved by: Councillor Hayes Seconded by: Councillor Warren

Be it resolved that By-law 2017-067 being a By-law to appoint Steve Tiernan as Fire
Chief for the Town of Gananoque be read three times and finally passed this 5% day of
September, 2017.

CARRIED

Paul McMunn, Manager of Public Works

UTIL-2017-03 - Emergency 6” Knife Gate Valve Repair - Pumping Station #2
ResoLuTION No. 2017-123 Moved by: Councillor Brooks Seconded by: Councillor Jansen

Be it resolved that the Council of the Town of Gananoque hereby authorize the
emergency repair of a broken valve and associated expenses at Pumping Station #2 in
the amount of $29,402.12 (Plus HST), to be funded from the wastewater reserves, as
presented in Council report UTIL-2017-03.

CARRIED

13 | CONFIRMATION BY-LAW
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ResoLuTioN No. 2017-124 Moved by: Councillor Jansen Seconded by: Councillor Brooks

Be it resolved that By-law 2017-072 being a By-law to confirm the proceedings of Council at its
meeting held on September 5, 2017 be read three times and finally passed this 5™ day of
September, 2017.

CARRIED
14 | ADJOURNMENT
Moved by: Councillor Hayes
Be it resolved that Council adjourn this regular meeting of Council at 6:30 PM.
CARRIED

Mayor, Erika Demchuk Deputy Clerk, Linda Robinson
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G+S NANOQUE
i~
Council Report —CD-2017-13

Council Date: September 19, 2017 ] IN CAMERA

Subject: Purchase and Sale Agreement — Island Harbour Club —
Acknowledgement and Direction

Author: Brenda Guy, Manager of Community Development OPEN COUNCIL

RECOMMENDATION:

BE IT RESOLVED THAT THE COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF GANANOQUE AUTHORIZE THE MAYOR AND
CLERK TO EXECUTE THE ACKNOWLEDGEMENT AND DIRECTION FOR THE POSTPONEMENT OF
INTEREST WITH ISLAND HARBOUR CLUB INC. FOR 175 ST. LAWRENCE STREET, AS PRESENTED IN
COUNCIL REPORT — CD-2017-13.

STRATEGIC PLAN COMMENTS:
Sector 6 — Governance — Strategic Initiative #4 - Town Council will ensure openness and transparency
in its operations.

BACKGROUND:

The Town of Gananoque originally entered into a Purchase and Sale Agreement with R.M.P.
Construction & Development Ltd. The agreement was approved on June 12, 2013 and closed on
February 21, 2014. Additionally, amending agreements to the “Table of Critical Dates” occurred on
December 16, 2015 and February 8, 2017.

Correspondence has been received by legal counsel on behalf of the Island Harbour Club for the
following:

On title, there is a Notice with the Town of Gananoque, which is an Option to Re-Purchase,
registered February 21, 2014 as Instrument No.LE62370. The Lender is seeking to obtain:

1) Confirmation from the Town that this agreement continues to be in good standing and there
are no outstanding disputes in respect thereof; and

2) The Town’s subordination to the Lender’s security.

INFORMATION/DISCUSSION:
Staff have no concerns with a letter being issued that the agreement is currently in good standing and
confirming that there are no outstanding disputes.

Staff consulted with the Town'’s solicitor on the second clause in relation to “subordination to the
Lender’s security”. Essentially, this is a Postponement of Interest and it means that the Town will
permit the lender to put their financing in first position for priority. If there is a default they are able
to sell under power of sale and the Town’s option is no longer available.
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Report to Council September 19, 2017
CD-2017-13

“If they have obtained the building permits, the option agreement cannot be triggered, and there
would be no reason to refuse to postpone the option agreement to the financing.

If they have not obtained building permits the option agreement is the Town’s “lever” to ensure
development occurs”

Further to the above, the Town has received a Record of Site Condition and a Conditional Building
Permit has been issued. Legal counsel indicated that the Town’s consent is not needed for financing
as remediation is complete and the RSC s filed. There is no incentive on the Town’s part to hold on to
the option agreement.

Staff recommend that the Mayor and Clerk be authorized to execute the Acknowledgement and
Direction for the Postponement of Interest.

APPLICABLE POLICY/LEGISLATION:
Purchase and Sale Agreements

FINANCIAL CONSIDERATIONS:
n/a

CONSULTATIONS:
Tony Fleming, Cunningham Swan
Shellee Fournier, CAO

ATTACHMENTS:
Attachment 1 — Postponement of Interest

Brenda Guy, Manager of Community Development

Melanie Kirkby, Treasurer
Certifies that unless otherwise provided for in this report the funds are contained within the approved Budgets
and that the financial transactions are in compliance with Council’s own policies and guidelines and the Municipal
Act and regulations.

APPROVAL

Shellee Fournier, CAO

Page 2 of 2





ACKNOWLEDGMENT AND DIRECTION

TO: Blaney McMurtry LLP
(the “Blaneys”)

RE: Fiera FP Real Estate Financing Fund, L.P. (the “Lender”) loan to Island
Harbour Club Inc. (the “Borrower”) relating to 175 St. Lawrence Street,
Gananoque, Ontario (the “Property”)

AND RE: Postponement by The Corporation of the Town of Gananoque (the “Town”)
of its Notice of Option to Re-purchase Agreement registered on title to the
Property to the Charge/Mortgage and Notice of Assignment of Rents -
General to be registered in favour of the Lender in connection with the
Loan

THE UNDERSIGNED HEREBY confirms having reviewed the information attached and
confirms this information is accurate, and hereby irrevocably authorizes and directs you to sign
and register electronically on the Town'’s behalf the following documents in the forms attached:

1. Postponement of Interest.

THE UNDERSIGNED HEREBY ACKNOWLEDGES the effect of the electronic documents
described in this Acknowledgment and Direction have been fully explained to the undersigned
by its solicitors, and the undersigned understands the Town is a party to and bound by the
terms and provisions of these electronic documents to the same extent as if it had signed these
documents originally. The undersigned signing officers are in fact the authorized signing officers
of the Town and have not misrepresented their identities to Blaneys.

THE UNDERSIGNED hereby authorizes you to make any minor, non-material alterations that
may be required by the Land Registry Office to effect certification of the electronic documents
described in this Acknowledgment and Direction by the Land Registry Office.

THE UNDERSIGNED confirms execution of this Acknowledgment and Direction by facsimile
transmission or email transmission shall be binding upon the Town and its successors and
assigns and may be relied upon by you as if it was an original.

IN THE EVENT of any investigation by the Director of Titles appointed under subsection 9(1) of
the Land Titles Act (the “Director”) regarding suspected fraudulent or unlawful activity or
registration in connection with the documents attached to this Acknowledgment and Direction,
the undersigned hereby consents to you releasing to the Director a true copy of this
Acknowledgment and Direction upon request by the Director.

DATED as of the 7" day of September, 2017.

THE CORPORATION OF THE TOWN OF
GANANOQUE

Per:
Name:
Title:

Per:
Name:
Title:

I/We have the authority to bind the Corporation.





LRO # 28 Postponement Of Interest In preparation on 2017 09 07 at 15:09

This document has not been submitted and may be incomplete.
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Properties

PIN 44249 - 0098 LT

Description LT 552-554 PL 167; LT 546 W GANANOQUE RIVER, 547 W GANANOQUE RIVER, 548
W GANANOQUE RIVER, 549 W GANANOQUE RIVER, 550 W GANANOQUE RIVER,
551 W GANANOQUE RIVER PL 86 AMENDED BY PL 92; GANANOQUE; SUBJECT TO
AN EASEMENT IN FAVOUR OF LT 1009 E GANANOQUE RIVER PL 86 ALSO SHOWN
AS BLKM; PT LT A E GANANOQUE RIVER PL 86 AS IN 16G1023 AS IN LE62371,

TOWN OF GANANOQUE

Address 175 ST LAWRENCE ST
GANANOQUE

Source Instruments

Registration No. Date Type of Instrument
LE62370 2014 02 21 Notice

Party From(s)

Name THE CORPORATION OF THE TOWN OF GANANOQUE

Acting as a company
Address for Service 30 King Street East
Gananoque, Ontario
K7G 2T6
This document is not authorized under Power of Attorney by this party.

This document is being authorized by a municipal corporation .

Party To(s) Capacity

Share

Name FIERA FP REAL ESTATE FINANCING FUND INC.
Acting as a company

Address for Service 3131 St. Martin Boulevard West, Suite 500
Laval, Quebec
H7T 275

This transaction is for a partnership purpose within the meaning of the Limited Partnerships Act.

| am a general partner, the firm name of the Limited Partnership is FIERA FP REAL ESTATE FINANCING FUND, L.P.

Statements

The applicant postpones the rights under the selected instrument to the rights under an instrument registered as number CHARGE 175

ST. LAWRENCE ST.

Schedule: The applicant postpones the rights under the selected instrument to the rights under an instrument reigstered as number TO

BE INSERTED - GAR 175 ST. LAWRENCE STREET

File Number

Party To Client File Number : 1112240002
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CORPORATION OF THE TOWN OF GANANOQUE

BY-LAW NO. 2017-075

BEING A BY-LAW TO AUTHORIZE THE TOWN OF GANANOQUE
TO EXECUTE THE ACKNOWLEDGEMENT AND DIRECTION FOR THE POSTPONEMENT
OF INTEREST WITH ISLAND HARBOUR CLUB INC. FOR 175 ST. LAWRENCE STREET.

WHEREAS by Section 5 of the Municipal Act, 2001, S.0. 2001, c. 25, the powers of a
municipal corporation are to be exercised by its Council; and

WHEREAS the Municipal Act, 2001, S.0. 2001, c. 25, provides that the powers of every
Council are to be exercised by Bylaw; and

NOW THEREFORE the Council of The Corporation of The Town of Gananoque hereby
enacts as follows:

1) That Council hereby authorizes that The Town of Gananoque execute the
Acknowledgement and Direction for the postponement of interest with Island

Harbour Club Inc. for 175 St. Lawrence Street.

2) That the Mayor and Clerk are hereby authorized to execute any documents for
the postponement of interest.

3) That this by-law comes into force and effect as of the date of passing.

READ THREE TIMES and finally passed this 19t day of September, 2017.

Mayor, Erika Demchuk Clerk, Kelly Shipclark
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CORPORATION OF THE TOWN OF GANANOQUE

BYLAW NO. 2017-077

BEING A BY-LAW TO CONFIRM THE PROCEEDINGS OF THE COUNCIL
OF THE CORPORATION OF THE TOWN OF GANANOQUE AT
ITS’ MEETING HELD ON SEPTEMBER 19, 2017.

WHEREAS by Section 5 of the Municipal Act, 2001, S.0. 2001, c. 25, the powers of a
municipal corporation are to be exercised by its Council; and

WHEREAS Subsection 2 of Section 11 of the Municipal Act, 2001, S.0. 2001, c. 25,
provides that the powers of every Council are to be exercised by By-law; and

WHEREAS it is deemed expedient that the proceedings of the Council of the
Corporation of the Town of Gananoque at these meetings be confirmed and adopted
by By-law.

NOW THEREFORE the Council of the Corporation of the Town of Gananoque hereby
enact as follows;

1. The action of the Council of the Corporation of the Town of Gananoque at its
meeting held on September 19, 2017, in respect of each recommendation
contained in the reports of the Committees and each motion and resolution
passed and other action taken by the Council of the Corporation of the Town
of Gananoque at its meetings is hereby adopted and confirmed as if all such
proceedings were expressly embodied in this by-law.

2. That Council confirm the motions adopted by Council at its meeting held on
September 19, 2017.

3. The Mayor and proper officials of the Corporation of the Town of Gananoque
are hereby authorized and directed to do all things necessary to give effect to
the action of the Council of the Corporation of the Town of Gananoque
referred to in the preceding section hereof.

4. The Mayor and Clerk are authorized and directed to execute all documents
necessary in that behalf and to affix thereto the seal of the Corporation of the

Town of Gananoque.

READ THREE TIMES and passed this 19t day of September, 2017.

Mayor, Erika Demchuk Clerk, Kelly Shipclark
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